
FANTASTIC FRONTLINE GOLF APARTMENTS IN LA
CALA

 Calanova Golf

REF# BEMD1280 €329,000

BEDS

2

BATHS

2

BUILT

132.0 m²

TERRACE

29.0 m²

These fantastic front line golf apartments in La Cala are located in a privileged position with spectacular sea
views. Neighbouring Calanova Golf is also blessed with magnificent views of the Mediterranean from
virtually all of its greens, and offers an excellent climate allowing year round play. The Club House includes
an exclusive social club for members and an excellent restaurant. The apartments can be found just 5
minutes from the beautiful town of La Cala, 15 minutes from Marbella and only 20 minutes from Málaga
Airport. Blending a cosmopolitan atmosphere with a village vibe, La Cala caters to the lifestyle of modern
international residents and their families. This beautiful little beach town boasts broad, golden, blue-flag
beaches and some of the finest gastronomy options on the coast. It’s the ideal setting for a sunset walk.

These fantastic front line golf apartments in La Cala provide the latest in lifestyle homes. Occupying an
elevated position and with breath-taking sea views the apartments provide the perfect balance of a bustling
Mediterranean atmosphere with a peaceful and private location. The community is a collection of 68
signature apartments with 2 and 3 bedrooms, thoughtfully designed to accommodate the many aspects of
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your new life on Spain’s sunshine coast.

Open plan living and dining areas within these fantastic front line golf apartments in La Cala make the most
of light and views. High quality, fully furnished kitchens deliver form, function and freedom for everyday
dining or generous entertaining. Terraces are fully plumbed, wired and ready to accommodate all the
features you would usually enjoy indoors. This becomes your living room for most of the year where you can
relax and take in the sun, enjoy a summer barbecue with family and friends, or just start the day outside with
your coffee in the morning sunlight.

The master bedrooms come with fitted wardrobes and a luxury en-suite bathroom with underfloor heating.

This boutique resort will remain an exclusive, tranquil environment where residents can enjoy a stunning
infinity pool. The pool is surrounded by a large chill-out area, giving the sense of an exclusive beach club.
The spa at the apartments includes an indoor heated pool, jacuzzi, Turkish steam bath, sauna and shower
jet circuit, ideal for finishing off a work out at the gym or simply to revive and refresh.

These fantastic front line golf apartments in La Cala are a lifestyle resort that includes a social area. If golf is
your addiction, you can brush up on your skills on the indoor golf simulator between rounds on the
neighbouring course. The younger members of the family are well catered for at the children’s entertainment
centre if they ever tire of the pool and beach. For those looking for peace and quiet, spend an afternoon at
the library and kick back with a good read. If you would like to know more about these fantastic front line golf
apartments in La Cala contact us today.

Prices from 329,000 to 1,275,000 Euros
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